REVISED

FORSYTH COUNTY

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

MEETING DATE: October 4, 2018 AGENDA ITEM NUMBER: ( 0

SUBJECT: RESOLUTION AWARDING CONTRACTS FOR THE PURCHASE OF MEDICAL
SUPPLIES

COUNTY MANAGER’S RECOMMENDATION OR COMMENTS:

SUMMARY OF INFORMATION:

After due advertisement, bids were received July 23, 2018, for the purchase of medical supplies for Forsyth
County Emergency Services. Terms of the bid specifications requested bidders to submit their best pricing for
each of the various medical supply items allowing the County the opportunity to select the lowest responsive,
responsible bidder for each item. The following is the total cost summary for the lowest responsive, responsible
bidder for each item listed in the bidding document:

Total Bid Amount

Southeastern Emergency Equipment $116,742.98

Bound Tree Medical, LLC 116,729.75

Henry Schein, Inc. 57,486.01
Medline Industries, Inc. 24.708.49

A bid was also received from Concordance Healthcare Solutions LLC; however, they failed to meet critical
requirements of the bid specifications and cannot be considered for any award.

Following review and evaluation of the bids received, it is the recommendation of the County Manager, the
Emergency Services Director, and the Purchasing Director that contracts be awarded to the lowest responsive,
responsible bidders as follows: Southeastern Emergency Equipment in the amount of $116,742.98, Bound Tree
Medical, LLC in the amount of $116,729.75, Henry Schein, Inc. in the amount of $57,486.01, and to Medline
Industries, Inc. in the amount of $24,708.49.

ATTACHMENTS:- X ] YES [_]NO

SIGNATURE: DATE:
COUNTY MANAGER




RESOLUTION AWARDING CONTRACTS FOR THE PURCHASE OF
MEDICAL SUPPLIES

WHEREAS, after due advertisement, bids were received and publicly opened by the
City/County Purchasing Department at 10:00 a.m. on July 23, 2018, for the purchase of medical
supplies for Forsyth County Emergency Services; and

WHEREAS, terms of the bid specifications requested bidders to submit their best
pricing for each of the various medical supply items allowing the County the opportunity to
select the lowest responsive, responsible bidder for each item. The following is the total cost
summary for the lowest responsive, responsible bidder for each item listed in the bidding
document:

Total Bid Amount
Southeastern Emergency Equipment $116,742.98
Bound Tree Medical, LLC 116,729.75
Henry Schein, Inc. 57,486.01
Medline Industries, Inc. 24,708.49

WHEREAS, following review and evaluation of the bids received it is the
recommendation of the County Manager, the General Services Director, and the Purchasing
Director that contracts be awarded to the above-identified lowest responsive, responsible bidders
and that the County Manager be authorized to execute contracts, on behalf of Forsyth County, in
those amounts with each vendor.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Forsyth County Board of
Commissioners that contracts for the purchase of medical supplies for Forsyth County
Emergency Services are hereby awarded to Southeastern Emergency Equipment in the amount of
$116,742.98, Bound Tree Medical, LLC in the amount of $1 16,729.75, Henry Schein, Inc. in the
amount of $57,486.01, and to Medline Industries, Inc. in the amount of $24,708.49, and that all
other bids are hereby rejected.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the County Manager and Clerk to the Board are
hereby authorized to execute, on behalf of Forsyth County, contracts for the purchase of medical
supplies for Forsyth County Emergency Services, as identified herein with Bound Tree Medical,
LLC, Henry Schein, Inc., Medline Industries, Inc. and Southeastern Emergency Equipment,
subject to a pre-audit certificate thereon by the County Chief Financial Officer, where applicable,
and approval as to form and legality by the County Attorney.

Adopted this 4™ day of October 2018



Attachment A

Description FCEMS Order Lot Size Typical Qty
Used per Year [ me T 30T ase 0T | 32470 00 T 3T
mim size each 10 i _m . $0.27 0.23
[OFA - 50mm iant sze each 10 18 | s0.28 $0.26 $0.23
[OPA - 80mm (Size 3) each 10 5048 | $0.28 $0.23 $023
Curaplex O2-NMAX Bitrac ED Mask wiieb and CO2Z Sampling Lines each 300 9.66 no bid no bid no bid
|- 02 MaxTrio Bitrac ED Mask, wiNeb $39.59 no bid no bid no bid
- Smart CapnoLine Pius (Oral/Nasal wilh O2 tubing) $9.35 no bid no bid no bid
Capnography NC adult box of 100 40 | $916.00 $1,100.00 no bid no bid
Capnography NC pediatric box of 25 10 $299.75 $334.25 no bid no bid
Capnography ET tube box of 100 7  $760.00 $881.00 no bid no bid
2.0mm ET Tube - Uncuffed Plain/Murphy each 10 | $0.60 $0.88 no bid no bid
2.5mm ET Tube - Cuffed Plain/Murphy each 10 $0.60 $3.90 no bid no bid
3.0mm ET Tube -Cuffed Plain/Murphy each 10 085 $2.61 no bid no bid
3.5mm ET Tube - Cuffed PlainMurphy each 10 $0.89 $2.61 no bid no bid
4.0mm ET Tube - Cuffed Plain/Murphy each 10 $0.89 $2.61 no bid no bid
4.5mm ET Tube - Cuffed Plain/Murphy eath 30 - $0.8% $2.61 no bid no bid
5.0mm ET Tube-Cuffed Plain/Murphy each 40 %089 $1.72 no bid no bid
|5.5mm ET Tube-Cuffed Plain/Murphy each 50 $0.89 $1.72 no bid no bid
6.0mm ET Tube-Murphy Eye, Low-pres Cuff each 80 $0.89 $1.72 no bid no bid
6.5mm ET Tube-Murphy Eye, Low-pres Cuff each 10 $0.89 $1.72 no bid no bid
7.0mm ET Tube-Murphy Eye, Low-pres Cuff each 80 $0.89 $1.72 no bid no bid
7.5mm ET Tube-Murphy Eye, Low-pres Cuff each 90 - $0.89 §1.72 no bid no bid
8.0mm ET Tube-Murphy Eye, Low-pres Cuff each 40 $0.89 $1.72 no bid no bid
Intubation Stylets - Adult 14fr & 12.5" box of 26 100 _ $34.98 $35.50 no bid no bid
Intubation Stylet - infant 6fr x10” box of 25 20 . $68.57 $88.00 ne bid no bid
Adult Coude Tip Bougle 15fr & 70cm each 150 M2 $4.87 no bid $4.95
Handtight Connector {NOT Quick Connect) each 52036 $30.21 ne bid no bid
Piastic Nipples "Christmas frees” each P $0.43 $0.41 $0.45
Cylinder wrench for D & E cylinders - metal each 30 $1.50 $1.84 $1.85 $1.54
Sugtion Tubing 3/16” x72in case of 50 $5.34 §34.50 $19.20 $62.50
1200c¢ Disp Suction Collection Canister with d case $135.70 $224.64 no bid $147.25
Instant Cold Pack, Ammonium Nitrate FREE, disposable, non-toxic, 6x6 siz each 800 $0.30 no bid $0.42 no bid
Instant Hot Pack, disposable, non-toxic, 6x7 size each 350 $0.22 $0.26 $0.42 no bid
Multi-trauma Dressing, Sterile 12" x 30" each 50 $0.86 $0.86 no bid $1.13
Vaseline/Petroleum Gauze, Sterile 3" x 9" each 100 $0.49 $0.61 $0.56 $0.49
Adult Traction Splint each 20 $138.95 $329.56 no bid $184.90
Pediatric Traction Splint each 20 $126.27 $329.56 no bid $184.90
Prosplint Adult Kit w carry case each 5 $154,98 $160.27 no bid $171.50
Settings Case of 30 30 $144,90 $147.30 no bid no bid
1mi Syringe with Luer-Lok tip {no needle) box of 100 15 $6.08 $34.00 no bid no bid
50cc Syringe Luerl.oc box 1 $9.78 $10.25 no bid $10.60
24 ga. X 0.75" Insyle Autoguard Shielded IV Catheter case of 4 boxes of 50 1 $387.98 $408.00 no bid $436.85
22 ga. X 1.0" Insyte Autoguard Shielded IV Catheter case of 4 boxes of 50 2 $96.99 $408.00 $499.00 $436.85
20ga. X 1.16" Insyte Autoguard Shielded IV Catheter case of 4 boxes of 50 35 $96.99 $408.00 $418.00 $436.85
18 ga. X 1.16" Insyte Autoguard Shielded IV Catheter case of 4 boxes of 50 50 $96.99 $408.00 no bid $436.85
16 ga. X 1.16" Insyte Autoguard Shielded IV Catheter case of 4 boxes of 50 4 $119.18 $430.00 no bid $458.75
Veniguard TM box of 500 30 $95.15 $170.00 no bid $221.90
Saline Lock box of 100 160 $80.95 $139.00 no bid no bid
Wall mount Sharps container (5qt mailbox kd) 20 $2.26 $10.40 no bid $3.99
Filter Needle - § Micron with Blunt Fill Tip 18g x 1 1/2", Sterile 1000/case 4 $156.25 no bid no bid $22129
Face Shield, Full, 7 1/2inches box of 24 4 $23.92 $33.60 no bid no bid
Tyvek Coveralls with Hood - Medium case of 25 1 $134.13 §171.25 no bid $148.15
Tyvek Coveralls with Hood - Large case of 25 1 $134.13 §171.25 no bid $148.15
Tyvek Coveralls with Hood - X Large case of 25 1 $134.13 $171.25 no bid $148.15
Tyvek Coveralls with Hood - 2X Large case of 25 1 $144.72 $183.25 no bid $148.15
Tyvek Coveralls with Hood - 3X Large case of 25 1 $153.10 $192.10 no bid no bid
Tyvek Coveralls with Hood - 4X Large case of 25 1 $16647 §$260.50 no bid no bid
10 drop/ml, 83", 1LL, 1PP Site, Spin Lock Connection box of 50 100 $62.50 no bid no bid no bid
Basic IV Admin Set 60 Drop setup microdrip 1 injection si box of 50 5 $74.11 no bid no bid no bid
4 way stopcock with 20" extention with 2 LL ports $1.41 $1.75 no bid $81.60
IV Normal Saline Flush, 10mi Prefilled Syringe box of 400 60 $36.00 $128.00 no bid $140.50
Disposable IV arm board, foam padded, 3" x 18" each 10 $0.87 $1.26 no bid §$1.22
Disposable IV arm board, foam padded, 3" x 12" each 10 $1.25 $2.26 no bid $2.00
Jumbo Gear Bag - Red each 24 $38.02 no bid no bid $63.90
3 " x § yards Cohesive Bandage, non-latex, tan each 1200 $1.20 no bid $1.58 no bid
Large Adult BP cuff eath 25 $11.72 no bid no bid $18.96




Attachment A

Description FCEMS Order Lotsiza | VRIS S

$TIE720.75 | §57,486.09 $24,,08 $116,742.9
Adult BP Cuff gach 100 $11.72 no bid no bid $14.74
Child 8P Cuff gach 50 - 172 no bid no bid $14.74
[Bed pans - plasiic case 25  $0a7 $1.06 $1.10 $88.60

BoundTres | $116720.75

The Bag Il - Disposable Pediatric BvM each 100 $9.17 $8.25 no bid $8.45
V-VAC Starter Kit each 12 $91.63 $31.66 $285.28 $62.40
V-VAC Replacement Cartridge each 12 $21.86 $19.80 §29.24 $2020
V-VAC Adapter Tips (4/pk} pack of 4 4 $27.59 $24.48 $30.06 $54.95
V-VAC Double Male Connectors (10/pk) pack of 10 4 $5.96 $5.30 no bid $5.38
V-VAC #18 French Catheters (4/pk) pack of 4 4 $13.10 $11.80 no bid $12.04
OPA - 55mm (Size 0) each 10 $0.87 $0.28 no bid no bid
OPA - 120mm (Size 6) eath 50 $0.87 $0.17 $0.32 $0.23
Softech Pediatric Nasal Cannula, 7ft. case of 50 2 $37.50 $9.00 no bid $24.50
Pediatric NRB Mask with Safety Vent, 7. case of 50 2 $58.18 $54.00 no bid no bid
Nasal Atomization Device without Syringe each 500 $6.47 $5.24 $7.06 $5.84
Easy Cap box of 6 100 $58.21 $52.44 no bid $53.55
Easy Cap Pediatric box of 60 $58.21 $53.10 no bid $53.55
to 42mm 0D box of 25 25 $69.57 $64.75 $87.50 $82.00
Waterproof 1/2" ape used 1o secure ET tubes box of 24 2 $57.47 $34.32 $66.00 no bid
Rhino brass regufator wiiter flow and DISS each 15 $192.35 $164.51 no bid $177.25
guage & 50psi DISS outlet each 15 $150.12 $711.01 no bid $148.20
Meconium Aspiralor suction with thumb port each $4.43 $3.96 no bid $4.04
Pharmaseal Plastic Tubing Connector 5in1 box $2.49 $1.24 no bid no bid
Bile Stick - Plastic, Individually wrapped each $0.37 $0.22 $6.75 $0.34
Sterile 4"x4", 12 ply gauze, 2 per package box 200 $2.18 $1.50 $2.75 $2.55
bandaid 3/4" x 3" box of 100 200 $1.95 $1.00 $2.90 $1.20
Sterile, Disposable Burn Sheet. 60" x 80" each 50 §1.87 $1.32 $2.30 $2.34
Prosplint Splint, Full Leg, Large, 43.5inch L x 19.5inch W each 5 $31.66 $30.25 no bid $34.75
Prosplint Spiint, Full Leg, Small, 37inch L x 1Sinch W each 5 $27.53 $14.54 no bid $29.20
11inch W each 5 $22.52 $19.31 no bid $21.88
L x 6.5inch W each 5 $15.20 $11.55 no bid $14.70
Prosplint Spiint, Wrist/Foreamm, Adull, 13inch L x 10.25inch W each 5 $8.97 $8.69 no bid $9.30
Prosplint Spiint, Wrist/Forearm, Pediatric, 7.5inch L x 6.5inch W each 5 $5.08 $4.46 no bid $4.65
Prosplint Spiini, Am, Large, 27inch L x 13inch W each 5 $15.61 $14.52 no bid $15.90
Prosplint Splint, Full Arm, Adult, 24inch L x 13inch W each 5 $14.89 $14.52 no bid §16.39
Prosplint Splint, Long Arm, Pediatric, 17.5inch L x 7inch W each 5 $11.16 $9.08 no bid $10.55
SAM Splint, Standard 4" W by 36°L each 210 $7.16 $4.62 $11.00 $6.35
| Triangular Bandage with two safely pins. each : $0.1 ] %
|Curaplex Extricalion Collar, Single Use, Adjusiable, & Case ol 30 3 $144.80 10200 o bid no bid
Head Immobilizer, Adjustable, Adutt. Case of 20 10 $77.20 $55.00 no bid no bid
Durapore Surgical Tape, Hypoallergenic Adhesive, 2" each 150 $2.06 $1.33 $1.53 $1.91
Combat Application Tourniquet (CAT) Gen 7 each 150 $22.59 $20.46 $29.00 $20.85
Safetyglide 21ga x 1 1/2” needle 50 per box box of 50 22 $15.63 $14.00 no bid $14.30
3cc Syringe Luerkoc box of 100 30 $32.65 $3.00 no bid $5.64
10cc Syringe LuerLoc box of 100 4 $8.61 $4.00 no bid $9.89
20cc Syringe Luerloc box of 50 5 $12.36 $3.00 o bid $10.89
S0cc Syringe CathTip box 1 $11.90 $10.25 no bid $10.70
ARS For Needle Decomprassion 14G x 3.25 inch with Protective Case each 175 $8.66 $7.711 no bid $7.78
Latex free disposabie tol $0.07 $0.06 no bid $0.09
Bench Seal Sharps C {31 contziner with rotor lid) 24 no bid $81.12 no bid $95.15
Sharps brackets and ench for wall mount sharps container 1 $13.50 $4.25 no bid $19.45
APEX, Pro Nitrile Exam Gloves, White Exterior - Black Interior, 12 inch, Smd box of 100 50 $11.75 $11.00 no bid $11.66
APEX Pro Nitrile Exam Gloves, White Exterior - Black Interior, 12 inch, Med box of 100 75 $11.75 $11.00 no bid $11.66
APEX Pro Nitrile Exam Gloves, White Exterior - Black Intérior, 12 inch, Larg box of 100 75 $11.75 $11.00 o bid $11.66
APEX Pro Nitrile Exam Gloves, White Exterior - Black Interior, 12 inch, X-L4 box of 100 35 $11.75 $11.00 no bid $11.66
Face mask, plealed with ear loops box of 50 50 $34.45 $1.50 $2.85 $2.10
Impervious Personal Protetion Gown, Blue, Universal Size each 50 $0.63 $0.40 §0.40 no bid
100m! 0.9% Normal Saline for IV administration case of 48 2 $152.16 $129.12 no bid no bid
1V Extenslon, 8", Removable Luer Lock Site, Pinch Clamp box of 50 20 $92.00 $66.50 no bid no bid
Disposable IV arm board, foam padded, 3" x 9" each 10 $0.91 $0.90 no bid $1.00
Omni Pro Red each 6 $247.85 $196.30 no bid $197.50
Airway Pro tntubation Tri-Fold Red each 6 $76.83 $51.70 no bid $63.60
Extra Fill Pro Red each 6 $56.86 $38.06 no bid $50.35
IV bag - blue each 4 $26.46 $23.60 no bid §27.15




Attachment A

Description FCEMS Order Lot Size u:z'::'rg?ar
3190, 720.15 480.01 | ZA.0049 | 3116,742.9
Trauma Responder Il gear bag RED each 1 $117.09 $103.68 no bid $119.45
Drug Case each 12 $77.43 $69.30 no bid $72.65
Pro Intubation mini-kit - RED eath 4 $63.55 $56.49 no bid $71.90
Ampule Medication Module - ROYAL BLUE each 4 $42.06 $39.60 no bid no bid
Oxy Pack - Green each 4 $102.17 $57.20 no bid $58.65
Adult stethoscope neon orange each 100 $3.85 $342 no bid $3.48
Child stethoscope black eath 25 $4.39 $3.00 no bid $4.02
MegaMover 1500 50 $17.36 $17.13 no bid $18.98
|Patient Restraints - Economy Limb holders pair of 2 (4ea) 175 $9.22 $8.18 no bid $10.65
Mediwrap blanket - baby Case of 100 2 ro bid $4.97 no bid no bid
108mm chart recording paper for PhysioControl LifePak 15 Roll 1400 $3.93 $3.61 no bid no bid
QUIK-COMBO w/REDIPAK preconnect. Packaged box of 10 each 500 $23.57 _32_0.90 no bid $27.49
QUIK-COMBO w/REDI-PAK pediatric RTS. Packaged box of § each 60 $25.72 | $25.30 no bid $29.40
Electronic Hypothermia Thermometer each 6 $8.41 $1.59 no bid $7.60
Kendrick Extrication Device each 2 $111.11 $107.03 no bid $113.50
Temporal Scanner (Temporal Arery Thenmometer) ¢ach 4 $363.01 $327.25 $400.00 $454.90
Blankets 100% synthetic w/bound edges lots of 8 25 $44.08 $34.40 no bid $56.45
Heavy Duty Vinyl Body Bag, Black 35" x 85" CDC Compliant each 50 $23.10 $17.18 $26.60 $30.50
ammonia inhalants box of 100 5 $3.04 $0.18 $0.22 $1.87
7.25" Trauma shears - orange handles ea 50 $1.85 $0.86 $1.35 $0.96
Henry Schein |  $57,486.01
20fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Robertazzi, latex free box of 10 2 $23.50 $26.40 $18.85 $20.30
24fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Robertazzi, latex free box of 10 2 $23.50 $26.40 $18.85 $20.30
26fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Robertazzi, latex free box of 10 2 $23.50 $27.50 $18.85 $20,30
28fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Robertazzi box of 10 35 $23.50 $26.40 $18.85 $20.30
30fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Roberlazzi, latex free box of 10 2 $23.50 $31.90 $18.85 $20.30
32fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Robertazzi box of 10 20 $23.50 $33.00 $18.85 $20.30
OPA - 80mm {Size 4) each 10 $0.87 $0.28 $0.21 $0.23
QPA - 100mm (Stze 5) each 50 $0.87 $0.28 $0.21 $0.23
02 Connecting tubing 7' case of 50 65 $27.00 $13.50 $12.00 $13.45
Convenience Bag, 1000cc, Emesis, High Density case 14 $78.00 $118.08 $57.00 no bid
Convenience Bag Dispenser each 2 $24.00 $88.00 $10,00 no bid
FDA approved kit ea 5 $34.00 $35.20 $33.93 $35.49
included) FDA approved kit ea 5 $34.00 $35.20 $33.93 $35.49
FDA approved kit €a 150 $32.50 $35.20 $32.20 $33.30
FDA approved kit 03 350 $32.50 $35.20 $32.20 $33.30
FDA approved kit ea 130 $32.50 $35.20 $32.20 $33.30
size 16 French Nasogastric Tubes sach $1.98 $2.35 $0.58 $1.79
Sterile/Disp Yankauer Suction Cath wivent and bulb tip case of 50 $29.00 $87.50 $17.50 no bid
20z Bulb Suction Syringe each $0.62 $0.74 $0.46 $0,63
4.5" x 4.1 yard roll Kerlix, sterile, 6 ply - individually packaged each 1000 $147 $1.30 $1.00 $1.13
Transparent, 1" Hypoallergenic, Perforated, Plastic Tape each 500 $0.69 $0.53 $0.51 $1.15
Disposable sterile scaipel # 10 box $4.37 $1.70 $1.18 $4.05
Fluidshield Fog Free Mask, with Wraparound Splashguard Visor, Pleat Styl each 20 $0.90 $0.55 $0.54 $21.89
Disposable Shoe Covers, Elastic Open, Non-conductive, Fluid Resistant case of 150 1 $13.33 $12.00 $7.50 $13.95
Male urinals - plastic case 25 $0.96 $0.48 $0.46 $1.00
Denture Cups with translucent iid case no bid $0.71 $0.12 $0.60
Fingemall pofish ramover pads in foll packs 200/bx case 1 $0.04 $0.03 $0.03 $0.03
Benzion Swabs case 5 $1.28 $0.39 $0.28 $0.47
Aleohal preps In foll packs 200Vbox case 26 $0.14 $0.01 $0.01 $27.60
Mediine | $24,708.49
Adult BVM, medium mask, medication port sach 1000 $10.00 $9.09 $16.62 $8.20
Spur - Disposable Neonate BVM each 50 $12.46 $12.05 no bid $8.90
Resuscitation Masks, Pink Hook Ring, Infant size each 100 $2.03 $1.65 no bid $1.48
14fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Robertazzi, latex free box of 10 2 $23.50 $28.60 no bid $20.80
18fr Nasopharyngeal Arwy-Ultra Robertazzi, latex free box of 10 2 $23.50 $28.60 no bid $20.80
OPA - 60mm (Size 1) each 10 $0.87 $0.28 $0.25 $0.23
OPA - 70mm (Size 2) each 10 $0.87 $0.28 $0.24 $0.23
Adutt NRB Mask w/Safety Vent case of 50 50 $55.00 $69.50 $78.60 $38.30
Adult Nasal Cannula case of 50 100 $18.00 $42.00 $30.95 $12.35
MicroMist Neb wiT Tube, Mouthpc & Resv case of 50 50 $36.64 $42.00 $63.27 $33.15
Nebulizer w/Adutt Mask cass of 50 30 $53.85 $70.50 $89.66 $48.85
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Description FCEMS Order Lot Size umi::ezr
$116,7 $57,436.01 $24,708.45 $116,744.5¢
GreenLine Fiber Optic laryngoscope handle, medium each $47.51 $43.33 no bid $40.10
GreenLine laryngoscope blade Mac# 2 box of 20 box 1 $7320 $85.40 no bid $70.55
GreenLine laryngoscope blade Mac# 3 box of 20 box 4 $73.20 $85.40 no bid $70.55
GreenLine laryngoscope blade Mac#4 box of 20 box 5 $73.20 $8540 no bid $70.55
GreenlLine laryngoscope blade Miller #0 box of 20 box 1 $7320 $85.40 no bid $70.55
GreenlLine laryngoscope blade Miler# 1 box of 20 box 1 $73.20 $85.40 no bid  $70.55
GreenLine laryngoscope blade Miller# 2 box of 20 box 1 $73.20 $85.40 no bid T $7055
GreenLine laryngoscope blade Miller # 3 box of 20 box 2 $73.20 $85.40 no bid . $70.58
GreenLine laryngoscope blade Miller#4 box of 20 box 2 $73.20 $85.40 no bid $70.55
Adult Magill Forceps 9.75" stainless steel each 12 $3.55 $4.13 $14.25 $3.35
Child Magil Forceps stainjess steel each 4 $3.42 $4.13 $29.00 $3.35
Thomas Endotrachael Tube Holder - Pediatric box of 25 10 $69.57 $64.75 $87.50 $63.25
size 10 French Nasogastric Tubes each $1.98 $2.35 no bid . $179
#8Fr Suction Catheter w/Safe-T-Vac Valve case of 50 $23.81 $10.50 $39.00 $9.45
[#10Fr Suction Catheter wiSafe-T-Vac Valve case of 50 $21.85 $10.50 $39.00 $945
|#12Fr Suction Catheter w/Safe-T-Vac Valve case of 50 $21.85 $10.50 $39.00 $9.45
#14Fr Suction Catheter w/Safe-T-Vac Valve case of 50 $21.85 $10.50 $39.00 $9.45
Lubricating Jelly, water soluble, sterile box $5.58 $5.76 $10.75 $4.89
6 x 9 Sterile Abdominal Pad each 24 $2.18 $2.20 no bid $1.64
Prosplint Spiint, Leg, Pediatric, 26.5inch L x 11inch W each 5 $17.56 $26.13 no bid $16.70
ProSplint Carrying Case, Nylon, Handle, Black each 2 $31.12 $29.32 no bid $23.65
SOF Tactical Tourniquet, Black, 1.5 wide. each 150 $25.99 $28.05 no bid $24.25
SWAT-Toumiquet each 150 $8.71 $13.04 no bid $8.40 |
Sharps Shuttle Case Case no bid $1.49 no bid $1.48
APEX Pro Nitrile Exam Gloves, White Exterior - Black Interior, 12 inch, 2X box of 90 1 $11.75 $12.00 no bid $11.66
APEX Pro Nitrile Exam Gloves, White Exterior - Black Interior, 12 inch, 3X-I box of 90 1 $11.75 $12.00 ne bid $11.66
Scorpion Safely Glasses, black frame, clear lens each 100 no bid $3.30 no bid $2.10
Fluidshield N95 Particulate Fitter Respirator and Surgical Mask - Regular box of 36 20 $23,03 $24.15 ne bid $21.25
Fluidshigld N95 Particulate Filter Respirator and Surgical Mask - Small box of 35 10 $23,03 $24.15 no bid $21.25
1000m! 0.9% Normal Saline for IV administration case of 14 225 §74.76 $73.92 $85.00 $66.50
500mi 0.9% Normal Saline for IV Administration case of 24 10 $107.52 $108.48 $125.00 $98.20
Quicklook AED-Red each 4 no bid $148.50 no bid $148.25
LNCS Pediatric Disposable SPO2 Sensor for PhysioConlro! LifePak 15 each 60 $275.31 $268.13 $325.00 $120.25
Red LNCS Patient cable 4ft each 30 $158.24 $169.95 $215.00 $140.60
Pediatric electrodes in 3 paks case of 10 boxes of 20 packs of 3 30 $106.66 no bid no bid $93.49
Blue Sensor Electrodes - R, Adull, Foam box of 50 packs of 10 380 $173.80 $160.00 no bid $159.00
Pillow standard size with fluid resistant (plastic) cover each 430 no bid $11.72 no bid $4.66
POVIDONE-IODINE WIPES (100) box 100 10 $3.72 $4.00 no bid $3.35
Sterile OB Kit each 20 $6.18 $6.05 no bid $5.60
9 ft staps Metal Automotive style buckle / Black Straps each 25 $7.99 $7.95 no bid $7.48
Ring cutler ea 25 $4.29 $7.43 $48.00 $3.35
Infant BP cuff each 25 $16.18 no bid no bid §$14.74
Southeastern| $116,742.98




